[image: Text

Description automatically generated with low confidence]


Note:
This template is intended for educational purposes only, without any express or implied warranty of any kind, including warranties of accuracy, completeness, or fitness for any particular purpose. You agree that your use of the template is without any recourse whatsoever to PG&E, SCE, SDG&E, or their affiliates. The template is a draft, and anyone using this document should seek the advice of an attorney to develop appropriate ordinance language to meet its jurisdiction’s specific needs, as state and local laws may differ.
Contact the Codes and Standards Reach Codes Team at info@LocalEnergyCodes.com for additional information.










	
	
	



This program is funded by California utility customers and administered by Pacific Gas and Electric Company, San Diego Gas & Electric Company (SDG&E®), and Southern California Edison Company under the auspices of the California Public Utilities Commission and in support of the California Energy Commission.
Model Ordinance
Energy Reach Code for New Single Family
 and Low-Rise Multifamily Buildings 
Version 1.2
April 2024
[bookmark: _Toc1187150530][bookmark: _Toc543197784]
Changes from Prior Versions
Please check LocalEnergyCodes.com to obtain the latest version of this document. 

Changes since Version 1.0:
· Version 1.1
· Attachment 1 has been added to include maximum values for margins by climate zone.
· Version 1.2
· Multifamily hot water readiness section has been moved to align more closely with proposed changes to the 2025 State Energy Code.
· Requirements for in-unit multifamily water heater electric readiness have been updated to reflect proposed changes to the 2025 State Energy Code.
· Additional requirements for central hot water systems in multifamily buildings have been added as an option.
· Electric readiness requirements for commercial boilers have been deleted.

Scope
· Requires higher energy performance for new single family and low-rise multifamily buildings.
· Uses source energy (expressed as EDR1 for single family) as the performance metric.
· Does not prohibit or prevent gas technologies.
· Extends electric readiness requirements:
· Exterior location for space heat pump compressor in single family
· Space and ventilation requirements for in-unit water heaters in multifamily buildings
· Electrical capacity requirements for multifamily central hot water systems, with an option to include space, ventilation, and condensate requirements
· Provides option to exempt free-standing ADUs and small single family homes.
· Provides option to encourage use of Certified Energy Analysts[footnoteRef:2] to document compliance. [2:  https://cabec.org/cea/] 

· Provides option to treat additions and alterations to single family buildings within three years of original construction as serial permits, i.e., part of the newly constructed building.


Introduction
This model reach code requires higher performance margins for new single family and low-rise multifamily buildings. The margins can be set up to the amount that has been found to be cost-effective for both mixed-fuel and all-electric buildings. It may be possible to extend requirements to high-rise multifamily buildings in certain climate zones; contact the Reach Codes Program for more information. Bay Area Reach Codes also publishes model language that includes nonresidential and high-rise multifamily requirements for Climate Zones 3 and 4, as well as additional readiness requirements.

The model reach code amends the 2022 California Energy Code, effective through December 31, 2025. Any amendments to the State Code appear in strikeouts (deletions) and underlines (additions); a strikeout version must be submitted to the State (it may be a referenced attachment to the staff report). Any amendments to the Energy Code (Title 24, Part 6) must be approved by the California Energy Commission (CEC). All amendments to the State Code must be filed with the California Building Standards Commission. 

Amendments to the State Code require that the governing body of the local jurisdiction make express findings and cite the authorities used to adopt the ordinance. These vary depending upon the part of the code that is being modified. Refer to Guide for Local Amendments of Building Standards 2022 for more information.

Jurisdictions may wish to modify elements of the ordinance, such as those marked with the text “[Optional]”. When modifying the language, ensure all references are maintained and that the ordinance still meets the CEC requirements. Also, edit the Purpose section to reflect the changes.

The headings, footnotes and instructions (in blue) are for staff reference and should be removed from the final ordinance.

The ordinance text and CEQA determination language are provided as examples only. Ensure all ordinance materials are reviewed and verified by relevant jurisdiction staff and the jurisdiction (city/town/county) attorney. 

Check LocalEnergyCodes.com for the latest version of this document and related resources.



Model Ordinance
ORDINANCE AMENDING THE [City/Town/County of Jurisdiction] BUILDING CODE TO REQUIRE HIGHER ENERGY PERFORMANCE FOR NEW CONSTRUCTION

DELETE ALL BLUE TEXT AND FOOTNOTES

The California Building Code, Title 24, Part 6, adopted by the [City/Town/County of jurisdiction] codified under Chapter [municipal/county code reference (if not adopted in entirety, include local code references for each section)], is amended as specified below. 

[bookmark: _Toc14856747][bookmark: _Toc15996892][bookmark: _Toc15997100][bookmark: _Toc808564031][bookmark: _Toc423565892]Serial Permits
Section 100.0(e)2A is amended to read as follows: 

[bookmark: _Hlk92210758]Newly constructed buildings.
[bookmark: _Hlk94431796]A. All newly constructed buildings. Sections 110.0 through 110.12 apply to all newly constructed buildings within the scope of Section 100.0(a). In addition, newly constructed buildings shall meet the requirements of Subsections B, C, D or E, as applicable. [Optional] Any additions or alterations to a newly constructed single family building occurring within three years of the completion of the original construction shall be considered to be part of the original project.

Definitions
Section 100.1(b) is modified by adding the following definitions: 
CERTIFIED ENERGY ANALYST is a person registered as a Certified Energy Analyst with the California Association of Building Energy Consultants as of the date of submission of a Certificate of Compliance as required under Section 10.103.[footnoteRef:3] [Optional] [3:  From Government Code Section 65852.22.] 


FREE-STANDING ACCESSORY DWELLING UNIT is a detached building that is not intended for sale separate from the primary residence, on a lot that is zoned for single family or multifamily use, located on the same lot as an existing dwelling, and does not exceed 1,200[footnoteRef:4] square feet of total floor area. [ADUs (as well as smaller homes) can either be excepted or subject to specific requirements supported by the Cost Effectiveness Study. In either case, the definition should be modified to conform to local code.] [4:  This is the default maximum ADU size under State Law. Cities may limit ADUs to smaller sizes by ordinance.] 

[bookmark: _Toc904804739][bookmark: _Toc213786208]
NEWLY CONSTRUCTED BUILDING [Optional, if not using the standard definition in the code; see Substantial Remodels and New Construction Definitions]

Performance Requirements
Single Family
A new section, 150.1(b)1A, is added to read as follows: 

In addition, the total source energy (EDR1) of the Proposed Design Building shall be less than the EDR1 of the Standard Design Building by a compliance margin of [XX – populate with value from Attachment 1].

EXCEPTION 1 to Section 150.1(b)1.A. A Free-Standing Accessory Dwelling Unit [Option: or a dwelling unit of no more than [XX] square feet of conditioned floor space] shall have a compliance margin of [YY – populate with value from Attachment 1].

[Alternate] EXCEPTION 1 to Section 150.1(b)1.A. A Free-Standing Accessory Dwelling Unit [Option: or a dwelling of no more than XX square feet of conditioned floor space].

[Optional] EXCEPTION 2 to Section 150.1(b)1.A. If the Certificate of Compliance is prepared and signed by a Certified Energy Analyst, the compliance margin may be reduced by one point, but in no event shall be less than zero. 

Multifamily
Section 170.1 is modified to read as follows: 

SECTION 170.1 – PERFORMANCE APPROACH: ENERGY BUDGETS 
A building complies with the performance approach if the TDV energy budget calculated for the Proposed Design Building under Subsection (b) is no greater than the TDV energy budget calculated for the Standard Design Building under Subsection (a). Additionally, the energy budget, expressed in terms of source energy, of a newly constructed low-rise multifamily building (less than four habitable stories) shall be at least [ZZ% – populate with value from Attachment 1] lower than that of the Standard Design Building.

[Optional] EXCEPTION 1 to Section 170.1. If the Certificate of Compliance is prepared and signed by a Certified Energy Analyst, the compliance margin may be reduced by one percentage point, but in no event shall be less than zero. 

Electric Readiness
Single Family
The first two paragraphs of Section 150.0 are modified to read as follows: 

SECTION 150.0 – MANDATORY FEATURES AND DEVICES
Single-family residential buildings shall comply with the applicable requirements of Sections 150(a) through 150.0(v).

NOTE: The requirements of Sections 150.0(a) through 150.0(r) and 150.0(t)3 apply to newly constructed buildings. Sections 150.2(a) and 150.2(b) specify which requirements of Sections 150.0(a) through 150.0(r) also apply to additions or alterations.

Section 150.0.(t) is modified to read as follows:

(t)       Heat Pump Space Heater Ready.
Systems using gas or propane furnace to serve individual dwelling units shall include the following:

1. A dedicated 240 volt branch circuit wiring shall be installed within 3 feet from the furnace and accessible to the furnace with no obstructions. The branch circuit conductors shall be rated at 30 amps minimum. The blank cover shall be identified as “240V ready”.  All electrical components shall be installed in accordance with the California Electrical Code.

2. The main electrical service panel shall have a reserved space to allow for the installation of a double pole circuit breaker for a future heat pump space heater installation. The reserved space shall be permanently marked as “For Future 240V use”.

3. A designated exterior location for a future heat pump compressor unit with either a drain or natural drainage for condensate.


Multifamily
Sections 160.9(a), (b), and (c) are hereby renumbered as Sections 160.9(b), (c), and (d), respectively.

A new Section 160.9(a) is added to read as follows:

(a) General Requirements. Multifamily buildings shall comply with the applicable requirements of subsection 160.9. The building electrical system shall be sized to meet the future electric requirements of the electric ready equipment specified in sections 160.9(a) through (e). The building main service conduit, the electrical system to the point specified in each subsection, and any on-site distribution transformers shall have sufficient capacity to supply full rated amperage at each electric ready appliance in accordance with the California Electrical Code.

A new Section 160.9(e) is added to read as follows:
Individual Heat Pump Water Heater Ready. Systems using gas or propane water heaters to serve individual dwelling units shall include the following components:
1. A dedicated 125 volt, 20 amp electrical receptacle that is connected to the electric panel with a 120/240 volt 3 conductor branch circuit rated to 30 amps minimum, within 3 feet from the water heater and accessible to the water heater with no obstructions. In addition, all the following:
A. Both ends of the unused conductor shall be labeled with the word “spare” and be electrically isolated; and
B. A reserved single pole circuit breaker space in the electrical panel adjacent to the circuit breaker for the branch circuit in A above and labeled with the words “Future 240V Use”; and
2. A condensate drain that is no more than 2 inches higher than the base of the installed water heater, and allows natural draining without pump assistance, and
3. The construction drawings shall designate a space at least 39 inches by 39 inches and 96 inches tall for the future location of heat pump water heater.
4. A ventilation method meeting one of the following:
A. The designated space for the future heat pump water heater shall have a minimum volume of 700 cubic feet; or
B. The designated space for the future heat pump water heater shall vent to a communicating space in the same pressure boundary via permanent openings with a minimum total NFA of 250 square inches., so that the total combined volume connected via permanent openings is 700 cubic feet or larger. The permanent openings shall be:
i. Fully louvered doors with fixed louvers; or
ii. Two permanent fixed openings located within 12 inches from the enclosure top and bottom;
C. The designated space for the future heat pump water heater shall include two 8 inches capped ducts, venting to the building exterior:
i. All ducts, connections, and building penetrations shall be sealed.
ii. Exhaust air ducts and all ducts which cross pressure boundaries shall be insulated to a minimum insulation level of R-6.
iii. Airflow from termination points shall be diverted away from each other.

A new Section 160.9(f) is added to read as follows:
Central Heat Pump Water Heater Ready. Central water heating systems using gas or propane to serve multiple dwelling units shall include dedicated circuits at the main building panel with sufficient power to support future conversion of all gas-fired service water heating equipment to electric equipment.

Other Sample Ordinance Sections
Section 2: CEQA 
This ordinance is exempt from CEQA under 15061(b)(3) on the grounds that these standards are more stringent than the State energy standards, there are no reasonably foreseeable adverse impacts and there is no possibility that the activity in question may have a significant effect on the environment. 

Section 3: Severability 
If any word, phrase sentence part, section, subsection or other portion of this amendment or any application thereof to any person or circumstance is declared void, unconstitutional, or invalid for any reason, then such word, phrase, sentence, part, section, subsection, or other portion, or the prescribed application thereof, shall be severable, and the remaining provisions of this amendment, and all applications thereof, not having been declared void, unconstitutional or invalid, shall remain in full force and effect. The [name of governing body] hereby declares that it would have passed this amendment and each section, subsection sentence, clause and phrase of this amendment, irrespective of the fact that any one or more sections, subsection, sentences, clauses or phrases is declared invalid. 

Section 4: Violations 
Violation of the requirements of this Chapter shall be considered an infraction of the [jurisdiction Municipal/County Code], punishable by all the sanctions prescribed in [cite local reference to infractions]. 

Section 5: Effective Date
This ordinance shall become effective as of [DATE], or upon approval by the California Energy Commission and filing the California Building Standards Commission (CBSC), whichever is later.

2024-04-12		2

Attachment 1: Maximum Compliance Margins

The tables below show the maximum compliance margin that can be achieved cost-effectively by both the all-electric and mixed fuel designs, within the state and federal regulations. Although only one non-preempted, cost-effective path is legally required, the study results support limiting the maximum margin to a value that can be achieved by both design types.

The Program recommends setting margins in the ordinance at any value that is less than or equal to the maximum Source Energy (EDR1) Margins in the table below. These values represent the highest cost-effective and non-preempted compliance margin achieved by both all-electric and mixed-fuel designs in the analysis. 

The appropriate value is, in most cases, lower than the maximum, and is dependent upon the climate zone and local objectives.  Ideally, set the compliance value at a level that will enable an all-electric building to comply with either the basic efficiency measures prescriptively required by codes (All-Electric Prescriptive Efficiency case) or with additional cost-effective efficiency measures (All-Electric Efficiency case). These levels usually require mixed-fuel buildings to include significant improvements to comply, in effect strongly encouraging all-electric construction. In most cases, the compliance margin should be different for each occupancy (Single Family, ADUs and Low-Rise Multifamily).

In certain climate zones and occupancies, however, a margin set at these levels may not be high enough to encourage all-electric construction; in these cases, jurisdictions may want to consider setting the margin as high as the All-Electric Efficiency and PV case. View the analysis results for all measure packages in the Cost Effectiveness Explorer to help guide this decision process. You can easily display the compliance margin, initial capital costs (or savings), and the first year GHG saving associated with each case. For additional information, consult with the Local Reach Codes program.

It is important to note that the compliance margin may not exceed the maximum value in the table below.

Note, where the maximum margin is zero (0), there is no cost-effective, non-preempted, and code compliant margin that exceeds that State Code for both all-electric and mixed-fuel buildings. In these cases, jurisdictions may wish to consider exempting the occupancy from the requirements.



Maximum Source Energy Compliance Margins by Occupancy


	Climate Zone
	Utility
	Single Family Homes
	Detached ADUs
	Low-Rise Multifamily

	1
	PGE
	22
	0
	15%

	2
	PGE
	14
	16
	10%

	3
	PGE
	12
	0
	10%

	4
	CPAU
	0
	0
	8%

	4
	PGE
	13
	0
	8%

	5
	PGE
	14
	16
	9%

	5
	PGE/SCG
	14
	16
	9%

	6
	SCE/SCG
	18
	0
	6%

	7
	SDGE
	18
	20
	8%

	8
	SCE/SCG
	17
	20
	5%

	9
	SCE/SCG
	16
	19
	5%

	10
	SCE/SCG
	14
	0
	7%

	10
	SDGE
	14
	19
	7%

	11
	PGE
	12
	0
	10%

	12
	PGE
	13
	16
	10%

	12
	SMUD/PGE
	0
	0
	10%

	13
	PGE
	12
	0
	9%

	14
	SCE/SCG
	13
	14
	7%

	14
	SDGE
	13
	14
	7%

	15
	SCE/SCG
	13
	0
	10%

	16
	PGE
	20
	18
	15%





Attachment 2: Alternative Requirements for Central Gas Water Heating Systems in Multifamily Buildings
The text below has been proposed for inclusion in the 2025 State Energy Code (45-Day Express Terms, dated March 28, 2024, page 587). These requirements, which include the addition of a new Joint Appendix 15, may be substituted for the text of 160.9(f) above.  It is recommended that the building official be consulted to determine how these requirements will be implemented.
A new Section 160.9(f) is added to read as follows:
1. Heat Pump Water Heater Ready. Central water heating systems using gas or propane to serve multiple dwelling units shall include the following:
1. The system input capacity of the gas or propane water heating system shall be determined as the sum of the input gas or propane capacity of all water heating devices associated with each gas or propane water heating system.
2. Space reserved shall include:
A. Heat Pump. The minimum space reserved shall include space for service clearances and air flow clearances and shall meet one of the following:
i. The space reserved shall be the space required for a heat pump water heater system that meets the total building hot water demand as calculated and documented by the responsible person associated with the project; or
ii. The space reserved shall meet the requirements specified in Joint Appendix JA15.2.1.
B. Tanks. The minimum space reserved shall include space for service clearances and shall meet one of the following:
i. The space reserved shall be the space required for a heat pump water heater system that meets the total building hot water demand as calculated and documented by the responsible person associated with the project; or
ii. The space reserved shall meet the requirements specified in Joint Appendix JA15.2.2. 
3. Ventilation shall be provided by meeting one of the following:
A. Physical space reserved for the heat pump shall be located outside; or
B. A pathway shall be reserved for future routing of supply and exhaust air via ductwork from the reserved heat pump location to a suitable outdoor location. Penetrations through the building envelope for louvers and ducts shall be planned and identified for future use. The reserved pathway and penetrations through the building envelope shall be sized to meet one of the following:
i. The reserved pathway and penetrations shall be sized to serve a heat pump water heater system that meets the total building hot water demand as calculated and documented by the responsible person associated with the project.
ii. The reserved pathway and penetrations shall be sized to meet the requirements specified in Joint Appendix JA15.2.3.
4. Condensate drainage piping. An approved receptacle that is sized per the California Plumbing Code for condensate drainage shall be installed within 3 feet of the reserved heat pump location, or piping shall be installed from within 3 feet of the reserved heat pump location to an approved discharge location that is sized in accordance with the California Plumbing Code, and meet one of the following:
A. Condensate drainage shall be sized to serve a heat pump water heater system that meets the total building hot water demand as calculated and documented by the responsible person associated with the project.
B. Condensate drainage piping shall be sized to meet the requirements specified in Joint Appendix JA15.2.4.
5. Electrical
A. Physical space shall be reserved on the bus system of the main switchboard or on the bus system of a distribution board to serve the future heat pump water heater system including the heat pump and temperature maintenance tanks. In addition, the physical space reserved shall be capable of providing adequate power to the future heat pump water heater in accordance with the following:
i. Heat Pump. Meet one of the following.
A. The electrical power required to power a heat pump water heater system heat pump that meets the total building hot water demand as calculated and documented by the responsible person associated with the project.
B. The electrical power required that meets the requirements specified for the heat pump in Joint Appendix JA15.2.5.
ii. Temperature Maintenance Tank. Meet one of the following.
A. The electrical power required to power a heat pump water heater system temperature maintenance tank that meets the total building hot water demand as calculated and documented by the responsible person associated with the project.
B. The electrical power required that meets the requirements specified for the temperature maintenance tank in Joint Appendix JA15.2.5.


A new Joint Appendix 15 is added to read as follows:
Appendix JA15 – Qualification Requirements for Central Heat Pump Water Heater Ready
JA15.1 Purpose and Scope
Joint Appendix JA15 provides sizing requirements, for electric ready infrastructure installed with gas or propane water heating systems to meet the requirement for electric readiness specified in Title 24, Part 6, Section 160.9(e) and (f).
JA15.2 Electric Ready Requirements
JA15.2.1 Heat Pump Space Requirements
Space shall be reserved for future installation of central heat pump water heaters. The space reserved shall meet the following requirements:
(a) If the gas water heating system has an input capacity less than 200,000 Btu per hour, the minimum space reserved for the heat pump shall be 2.0 square feet per 10,000 Btu per hour input of the gas or propane water heating system, and the minimum linear dimension of the space reserved shall be 48 linear inches.
(b) If the gas water heating system has an input capacity greater than or equal to 200,000 Btu per hour, the minimum space reserved for the heat pump shall be 3.6 square feet per 10,000 Btu per hour input of the gas or propane water heating system, and the minimum linear dimension of the space reserved shall be 84 linear inches.
JA15.2.1 Storage Tank Space Requirements
Space shall be reserved for future installation of hot water storage tanks. The space reserved shall meet the following requirements:
(a) If the input capacity of the gas water heating system is less than 200,000 Btu per hour, the minimum space reserved for the storage and temperature maintenance tanks shall be 4.4 square feet per 10,000 Btu per hour input of the gas or propane water heating system.
(b) If the input capacity of the gas water heating system is greater than or equal to 200,000 Btu per hour, the minimum physical space reserved for the storage and temperature maintenance tanks shall be 3.1 square feet per 10,000 Btu per hour input of the gas or propane water heating system.               
 JA15.2.3 Ventilation Requirements
The reserved pathway and penetrations through the building envelope shall meet the following requirements:
(a) If the input capacity of the gas water heating system is less than 200,000 Btu per hour, the minimum air flow rate shall be 70 CFM per 10,000 Btu per hour input of the gas or propane water heating system and the total external static pressure drop of ductwork and louvers shall not exceed 0.17 inch when the future heat pump water heater is installed.
(b) If the input capacity of the gas water heating system is greater than or equal to 200,000 Btu per hour, the minimum air flow rate shall be 420 CFM per 10,000 Btu per hour input of the gas or propane water heating system and the total external static pressure drop of ductwork and louvers shall not exceed 0.17 inch when the future heat pump water heater is installed.
JA15.2.4 Condensate Drainage Piping Requirements
The condensate drainage piping shall meet the following requirements:
(a) If the input capacity of the gas water heating system is less than 200,000 Btu per hour, condensate drainage shall be sized for 0.2 tons of refrigeration capacity per 10,000 Btu per hour input.
(b) If the input capacity of the gas water heating system is greater than or equal to 200,000 Btu per hour, condensate drainage shall be sized for 0.7 tons of refrigeration capacity per 10,000 Btu per hour input.
JA15.2.5 Electrical Requirements
The electrical system serving the heat pump shall meet the following requirements:
(a) If the input capacity of the gas water heating system is less than 200,000 Btu per hour, provide 0.1 kVA per 10,000 Btu per hour input.
(b) If the input capacity of the gas water heating system is greater than or equal to 200,000 Btu per hour, provide 1.1 kVA per 10,000 Btu per hour input.
The electrical system serving the temperature maintenance tank shall meet the following requirements:
(c) If the input capacity of the gas water heating system is less than 200,000 Btu per hour, provide 1.0 kVA per 10,000 Btu per hour input.
(d) If the input capacity of the gas water heating system is greater than or equal to 200,000 Btu per hour, provide 0.6 kVA per 10,000 Btu per hour input.
image1.gif
CALIFORNIA

CODES & STANDARDS
A STATEWIDE UTILITY PROGRAM




